Kimberlx Blevins

From: Amy Kohout <rivergirl4184@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2025 2:08 PM

To: Kimberly Blevins

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: Receipt from Carolina Comfort Heating & Air

EXTERNAL EMALIL: Please be careful with attachments or links

Receipt for HVAC
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Carolina Comfort Heating & Air <notifications@housecallpro.com>
Date: October 28, 2024 at 2:20:25 PM EDT

To: rivergirld184@gmail.com

Subject: Receipt from Carolina Comfort Heating & Air

Reply-To: carolinacomfortheating@gmail.com

Your receipt from Carolina Comfort Heating &

Air
Job Number: 294938
Service Date: Oct 25, 2024
Invoice Date: Oct 14, 2024
Customer Name: Amy Kohout
Service Address: 4184 NC-16 Jefferson, NC 28640
Services qty unit price amount

OnCallair Consultation . 1.0 $10,682.00 $10,682.00



